
Sleep
Create a healthy sleep routine

and try to go to sleep/get up at
the same time everyday with

no more than an hours
difference. Before bed, try
having down time, limiting

caffeine and sugar, having a
cool bedroom and limiting
screen time. Adolescents

should have around 8-10 hours
of sleep a night.

DIET
Nutrition is beneficial for both
the body and mind, and eating
a    balanced diet can help lift
mood, increase energy levels
and prevent    physical and

mental illnesses and diseases.
Eating 5 portions of fruit and

vegetables a day and including
wholegrains, meat, fish and

pulses whilst       limiting foods
high in sugar, fat and salt are

advised.

exercise
Regular physical activity is

associated with lower rates of      
depression and anxiety across

all age groups, which is
thought to be down to it

leading to chemical changes in
the brain. Find a form of

exercise that is enjoyable and
easily fitted into daily routines;

the NHS recommend 150
minutes of moderate aerobic

activity a week.

relaxation
Make time to de-stress from

the day and have some quality
‘you’ time doing something

enjoyable. Mindfulness is said
to help the mind and body

reconnect and helps to
appreciate things in life. Ways

to practise mindfulness are
meditation, yoga, journaling,
gratitude, listening to music,

being outside and deep
breathing techniques.

hydration
Keeping hydrated keeps your
organs and body working to
their full potential, leading to

balanced hormone levels.
When dehydrated the body

sends panic signals to the
brain, leading to feelings of

anxiety,    irritability,
sluggishness and feeling down.

Drinking water helps fight
fatigue and increases

concentration.

positive
self reflection

Building your emotional
intelligence allows you to

become more self aware and
have a better understanding of

your     emotions, thoughts,
goals, strengths, weaknesses,
achievements and your impact

on others. 

communicate
Talking about thoughts and
feelings can relieve negative

emotions and creates positive
support systems. Evidence

shows that we have a
fundamental need to feel close
to and valued by others, and
that  social relationships are

essential for promoting
wellbeing.

promoting
positive
mental
health

All of these are
important for good

wellbeing



ideas for self care activities
Highlight some activities below that you like to do or might like to try

sit in silence for 10 minutes

go for a long drive

listen to music write a gratitude listgo for a walk outside

paint, draw or colour read a book

go to a coffee shop and people watch

set a spending limit and go shopping try a new workout go to bed early

go to the cinema

tour a museum

take a nap have a warm bath

watch your favourite film

bake your favourite dessert

create a list of goals

rearrange your bedroom sign out of social media accounts

complete a random act of kindness

get a massage

order your favourite takaway food

go thrift shopping

write a short story

meditate

go for a spa day

take a short online class

feed the birds/ducks at the park

create a morning/evening routine

stretch

do a puzzle

try a new class/hobby

make a list of new habits you would like to adopt

sort through and throw away expired makeup/skin care

start or continue journaling

watch an inspiring ted talk

listen to a podcast

paint your nails

apply a face mask

rearrange your wardrobe

watch a documentary

do some yoga watch funny videos

look through old photos

explore a city watch the sunrise/set

create a vision board

clear your email inbox

write a letter to your younger self

build something with lego

notice 3 new things about your surroundings

write a recap of your week

drink enough water

try a new recipe

write some positive affirmations

plan your week ahead

do your makeup and dress in something that makes you happy

make a video and pretend you are on youtube

do some voluntary work

call a friend/family member

write a biography of yourself

reflect on how far you've come

admire the view

write 3 good things about 3 people you care about

buy some self help books
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my self care plan


